
Help us prevent teenage 

pregnancy in the DR
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In the Los Manguitos community, there are still many
challenges faced by adolescent girls and young women in
obtaining adequate menstrual and reproductive health and
counseling services. This situation has been worsened by the
COVID-19 crisis. Teen pregnancies are on the rise. With this
project the Foundation intends to improve its sexual,
reproductive and menstrual health services for its more than
200 young women to include: weekly health text messages;
monthly access to pregnancy tests; access to monthly
consultation and distribution of contraceptives; In addition to
an orientation and awareness program through art.

DESCRIPTION1



DuriIn the Dominican Republic, the statistics of adolescent

pregnancies, especially unwanted ones, have increased since

the beginning of COVID-19 due to the closure of schools and

limited access to sexual and reproductive health services. But

teenage pregnancy has been a challenge before the pandemic.

The most recent Demographic and Health Survey found that

29% of girls under the age of 19 were already mothers.

Evidence from past epidemics shows that resources are often

diverted from routine medical care, further increasing the

chances of getting pregnant late.

CHALLENGE2



The Foundation will invest efforts and resources in improving 
its sexual, reproductive and menstrual health services for its 
more than 200 young women and will adapt to the new 
challenges of COVID-19. The new services will include weekly 
online counseling on sexual, reproductive and menstrual health 
and rights; monthly access to pregnancy tests; access to 
monthly health consultation and distribution of contraceptives; 
and access to reusable sanitary pads and menstrual cups. All in-
person services will follow COVID-19 security protocols and will 
have parental consent.

We will also implement a constant program of orientation in 
sexual and reproductive health through art: poetry, dance and 
music.

SOLUTION3



Increasing accessibility to sexual, reproductive and menstrual 
health information and services will reduce adolescent 
pregnancy rates in our community. The community foundation 
for the Development of Sleeves, in collaboration with the 
Funcomas Foundation and other social entities, integrates 
leadership development in all its programs. Young women 
accessing these services will leverage their leadership skills and 
knowledge of sexual, reproductive and menstrual health to be 
effective local advocates for greater access and rights.
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