
 
 

+ 91 8585995995

C - 2 / 2200, Vasant Kunj, 

New Delhi - 110070, India

hello@responsenet.org

Contact us to learn how we can
partner to spread, share and

serve together.

www.responsenet.org

www.delhifoodbanking.org

Join Us
Contribute and support  ongoing projects to
bridge the demand and supply gaps in many
ways.
 
 
 
 
 
 

Donate on our website

Sponsor meals for children

Volunteer time and expertise 

Employee giving 



 
Delhi NCR FoodBank
We connect freshly cooked meals to those in 
need every day in a sustained, systematic
process to fight hunger across India.
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
We focus on children up to school going
ages attending nonformal schools across
India with the objective of bettering their
health, education, and safety.
 
Delhi NCR FoodBank works with
implementation partners to replicate the
model and help significantly evolve into a
network of organically operated feeding
centers catering to children to help them
realize their potential for a better future
with the foundation of creating access to
food.
 
Supporters:
50,000 Individuals | 54 Institutions | 135
Corporations
 

 
Responsenet
Established in 2007, Responsenet  is a
non-profit engaged in providing system-
changing innovations and community-
centric implementation to solve deep-
rooted problems.
 
We believe right innovations and right
partnerships have the ability to create the
right and lasting impact for radical yet
sustainable transformations.
 
Areas of Impact:
Health | Nutrition | Disaster Relief | Water
Sanitation & Hygiene | Education |
Livelihoods | Financial Inclusion
 

Over 18 million meals served

15,000+ children benefit daily

Distributed to 64 feeding sites

37 feeding partners in 12 cities


