
40 total surveys were returned. Data is collected from these 40 surveys. 

 

1. Explain your knowledge about child sexual abuse 

(CSA) before seeing the film and participating in 

the after-show production. 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Moderate 

 Minimal 

 

 

 

 

 

2. Describe your knowledge about human 

trafficking before seeing the film and 

participating in the after-show production. 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Moderate 

 Minimal 

 

 

 

 

3. Explain your knowledge about CSA after seeing 

the film and participating in the after-show 

production. 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Moderate 

 Minimal 
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Explain your knowledge about child 
sexual abuse (CSA) before seeing the 
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Explain your knowledge about CSA 
after seeing the film and participating 

in the after-show production 

Excellent

Very Good

Good

Moderate

Minimal



4. Your knowledge about human trafficking after 

seeing the film and participating in the after-

show production 

 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Moderate 

 Minimal 

 

 

 

 

 

 

5. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the physical outcomes? 

 

 A great deal 

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

 

6. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the psychological outcomes? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 
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Explain your knowledge about human 
trafficking after seeing the film and 

participating in the after-show 
production 
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Very Good

Good

Moderate

Minimal
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Did the film & discussion give you a 
better understanding of the effect of 

CSA and human trafficking on the 
psychological outcomes? 

A great deal

A good deal
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A little



7. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the behavioral outcomes? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

8. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the personal income? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

 

9. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the health outcomes? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 
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Did the film & discussion give you a 
better understanding of the effect of 

CSA and human trafficking on the 
behavioral outcomes? 

A great deal

A good deal
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Did the film & discussion give you a 
better understanding of the effect of 

CSA and human trafficking on 
personal income? 

A great deal
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Did the film & discussion give you a 
better understanding of the effect of CSA 

and human trafficking on the health 
outcomes? 

A great deal

A good deal

Moderately

Some

A little



10. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the social and societal outcomes? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

 

11. Did the film & discussion give you a better 

understanding of the effect of CSA and human 

trafficking on the overall financial outcomes of 

the U.S.? 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

12. Did the film and discussion help you acquire a 

better understanding of your role in reaching 

the community with information about CSA in 

terms of educating immediate friends and 

family? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 
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Did the film and discussion help you 
acquire a better understanding of your 

role in reaching the community with 
information about CSA in terms of 

educating immediate friends and family? 

A great deal

A good deal

Moderately

Some

A little



13. Did the film and discussion help you acquire a 

better understanding of your role in reaching 

the community with information about CSA in 

terms of providing media outreach? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

14. Did the film and discussion help you acquire a 

better understanding of your role in reaching 

the community with information about CSA in 

terms of providing information to schools 

and/or community groups? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

15. Did the film and discussion help you acquire a 

better understanding of your role in reaching 

the community with information about CSA in 

terms of how to find out who to report to? 

 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 
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Did the film and discussion help you 
acquire a better understanding of your 

role in reaching the community with 
information about CSA in terms of 

providing media outreach? 
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 Did the film and discussion help you 

acquire a better understanding of your 
role in reaching the community with 

information about CSA in terms of how to 
find out who to report to? 

A great deal

A good deal

Moderately

Some

A little



16. Did the film and discussion help you acquire a 

better understanding of your role in reaching 

the community with information about CSA in 

terms of how to find out how to report? 

 A great deal   

 A good deal 

 Moderately 

 Some 

 A little 

 

 

 

 

 

17. How would you rate the quality of the 

presentation? 

 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Fair 

 Poor 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

18. How would you rate the quality of the film? 

 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Fair 

 Poor 
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Did the film and discussion help you 
acquire a better understanding of your role 

in reaching the community with 
information about CSA in terms of how to 

find out how to report? 

A great deal
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A little
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How would you rate the quality of the 
film? 

Excellent

Very Good

Good
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Poor



19. How would you rate the presentation led by 

Pamela Pine, Ph.D., MPH? 

 

 Excellent 

 Very Good  

 Good 

 Fair 

 Poor 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

20. How would you rate the location of the 

training?  

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Fair 

 Poor 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

21. How would you rate the content given at the 

presentation? 

 

 Excellent 

 Very Good 

 Good 

 Fair 

 Poor 
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How would you rate the location of the 
training? 

Excellent

Very Good
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22. How likely is it that you would recommend this presentation to a colleague? (Circle one). 

Not at all likely                     Extremely likely 

0 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 
Average score: 8.7 

 

23. Do you have any recommendations for how to improve the symposium?  

 Have a longer session 

 Give out information about places that help children who are victims of trafficking 

 


