
Nangabo  Environmental  Conservation and  

Economic  Empowerment Association 

Spring before  protection  

Spring after protection 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

(c) AFFILIATION 

ITF– International Tree Foundation (UK) 

ADC– Austrian  Development  Cooperation 

SOGEA-SATOM-ISSA– Initiative  SOGEA 

SATOM for  Africa 

EDWA– Entebbe District Wildlife Association 

 

LOGOS 

D) How to become  a member 

 Volunteer in our programmes 

 Network  with  us 

 Make  a cash  or  kind  contribution 

 Introduce NECEA to a potential  partner 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

NECEA headquarters Nangabo 

 

Norman Juuko 

Executive  Chairman 

NECEA 

P.O. Box 25578  

Kampala, 

UGANDA, EAST AFRICA 

Tel: +25672693079 

Email: normanjuko@necea.org   

Website: www.necea.org  

 

 

Training  WASH user committees at NECEA  
Headquarters 

IV) LEADERSSHIP TRAINING 



(A) BACKGROUND 

NECEA (Nangabo  Environmental  Conserva-
tion and  Economic Empowerment Associa-
tion) is  a not  for  profit  Community  Based  
Organisation (CBO) registered with  the  Di-
rectorate  of  Community  Based  Services 
(Wakiso  District) in  2006.  It  is  membership  
organisation  comprised of  residents in 
Nangabo   Sub-County. NECEA works  with   
communities  within  Wakiso  District  and 
beyond. 
 

Vision 
NECEA recognizes  and strives to promote  
awareness  of  the  value  of  natural  environ-
ment.  We  represent people’s  desires  natu-
ral  assets and encourages  moves  towards  
sustainable   systems.  We  achieve  this  
through  education research,  advocacy and  
action  in co-operation with  other  communi-
ty  groups and  government. 
 

Mission 
To  use  education, partnership , technology 
and commitment to  serve in  constructive 
transformation of  the  environment 
 
(B) STRATEGIC OBJECTIVES 

(I) Develop an environment conservation 
programme in schools and  communities 
(i) Implement a programme  of water, sanita-
tion and health (WASH) for  schools  and com-
munities 
(iii) Improve the livelihood of  community 
members through various productive  social, 
economic initiative like  mobilizing members 
to form saving and credit  societies, undertak-
ing viable projects like  vegetable growing 
and training residents in entrepreneurship 
skills and financial literacy 
 

 

(i) PROTECTING /IMPROVING  COMMUNITY WATER 

SOURCES 

Namulondo spring, Bamba before protection 

Namulondo spring, Bamba during construction 

Namulondo spring  water tank after construction 

(ii) CONDUCTING  HYGIENE CAMPAIGNS IN 

SCHOOLS 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Iii) ENGAGING  IN VIABLE PROJECTS  SUCH AS     

VEGETABLE  GROWING & COMMERCIAL TREE PLANT-

ING 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Hygiene campaign at  Gitta Primary  School, Kitagobwa 

Students engaged  in  Vegetable  gardening at NECEA  
headquarter 

PAST/PRESENT ACTIVITIES 

Training  residents of Nangabo  in nursery   
establishment and maintenance 


